
$995,000 - 510 County Road 2136, Lometa
MLS® #4019679 

$995,000
2 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 2,721 sqft
Residential on 20.02 Acres

Skyview Ranch, Lometa, TX

Escape to your own Texas Hill Country retreat
at 510 CR 2136! This stunning 20-acre
property offers breathtaking 360&#176; hillside
views and a beautifully designed steel-framed
home that blends modern farmhouse charm
with thoughtful functionality. Inside, enjoy
10-foot ceilings, hand scraped, wood-like tile
flooring, plantation shutters, and an
open-concept layout. The gourmet kitchen
features granite countertops, stainless steel
appliances, a deep farm-style sink, two
oversized islands (one freestanding), and bar
stools included. The spacious great room and
dining area are perfect for entertaining, while
the large primary suite boasts a walk-in closet
and luxurious ensuite bath. Additional
highlights include a dedicated office, guest
suite, laundry room with washer/dryer, and
abundant storage. Outdoors, relax on the
expansive front and back porches or host
gatherings under the large pavilion. Property
includes a 3-car carport, 2-car finished garage,
and 40x40 barn with 110/220 power. A rare
gem offering peaceful country living with
premium upgrades!

Built in 2018

Essential Information

MLS® # 4019679

Price $995,000

Bedrooms 2



Bathrooms 3.00

Full Baths 3

Square Footage 2,721

Acres 20.02

Year Built 2018

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Water Feature/View

View Hills

Community Information

Address 510 County Road 2136

Area LP

Subdivision Skyview Ranch

City Lometa

County Lampasas

State TX

Zip Code 76853

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Connected, Sewer Connected, Water Connected

Features None

Parking Attached, Door-Multi, Detached, Garage, Garage Faces Side

# of Garages 3

Garages Garage Door Opener

Interior

Interior Tile

Appliances Dishwasher, Electric Range, Electric Water Heater, Microwave

Heating Central, Electric

# of Stories 1

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Features Rain Gutters

Lot Description Agricultural, Landscaped, Sprinklers Automatic, Sprinklers In Ground,
Xeriscape



Roof Metal

Construction Metal Siding, Stone, Spray Foam Insulation

Foundation Slab

School Information

District Lometa ISD

Elementary Lometa

Middle Lometa

High Lometa

Additional Information

Date Listed June 3rd, 2025

Days on Website 130

Days on Market 34

HOA Fees 100

HOA Fees Freq. Annually
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