
$1,350,000 - 2410 Flite Acres Rd, Wimberley
MLS® #9324540 

$1,350,000
1 Bedroom, 1.00 Bathroom, 858 sqft
Residential on 1.67 Acres

Flite Acres Sec 1, Wimberley, TX

A riverside Escape in Wimberley!
Discover the perfect blend of privacy, natural
beauty, and modern comfort at 2410 Flite
Acres Road in Wimberley, Texas. This inviting
1-bedroom, 1-bathroom home offers 858
square feet of contemporary living space,
thoughtfully placed on a peaceful 1.67-acre lot
with 200 feet of sought-after Blanco River
frontage.Built in 2020, the home features
vaulted ceilings, stylish modern finishes, and
generous outdoor living areas ideal for relaxing
or entertaining beneath mature shade trees. A
pre-poured foundation slab offers the potential
for a future patio, guest house, or expanded
outdoor space. Natural cliffs across the river
enhance the propertyâ€™s seclusion and
provide a beautiful backdrop. Located just
minutes from the heart of downtown
Wimberley, this property is well-suited as a
weekend retreat, a cozy full-time residence, or
a guest house while you build your dream
home. With utilities in place and riverfront
properties becoming increasingly scarce at this
price point, this is truly an exceptional
opportunity to own a piece of the Wimberley
lifestyle.

Built in 2020

Essential Information

MLS® # 9324540

Price $1,350,000



Bedrooms 1

Bathrooms 1.00

Full Baths 1

Square Footage 858

Acres 1.67

Year Built 2020

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Status Active

Water Feature/View

View Hills,River,TreesWoods,Water,Blanco River

Is Waterfront Yes

Water Body Blanco River

Community Information

Address 2410 Flite Acres Rd

Area HW

Subdivision Flite Acres Sec 1

City Wimberley

County Hays

State TX

Zip Code 78676

Amenities

Utilities Electricity Connected, Water Connected

Features None

Parking Carport, Open, Paved

Interior

Interior See Remarks

Appliances Electric Range, Microwave

Heating Electric, See Remarks

# of Stories 1

Stories One

Exterior

Exterior Features Exterior Steps

Lot Description Gentle Sloping, Trees Medium Size



Roof Metal

Construction HardiPlank Type

Foundation Slab

School Information

District Wimberley ISD

Elementary Blue Hole

Middle Danforth

High Wimberley

Additional Information

Date Listed May 1st, 2025

Days on Website 164

Days on Market 1
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non-commercial use and may not be used for any purpose other than to identify prospective properties consumers may
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